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Abstract: 
Background: The nature of the work in an intensive care unit (ICU) imposes tremendous 
tension and stress on nurses. The ICU nurses are confronted not only by the increasing 
demand for quality care by patient, patient's family and the organization, but also by the 
demand for technological excellence. Aim: the aim of this study is to identify factors causing 
stress among nurses working in the intensive care environment in two different Egyptian 
governorates. Subjects & Methods: A descriptive exploratory design was used in this study. 
Setting:  It was carried out at six adult ICUs of four different hospitals at Alexandria and 
Damanhour cities.  Subjects: A convenience sample of 150 nurses was utilized in this study. 
Tools: The data was collected through distribution of self-administered questionnaire of ICU 
nurses’ work related stresses which included Expanded Nursing Stress Scale (ENSS). 
Results: ICU nurses were stressed, with the greatest perceived sources of stress being 
"workload" (mean=3.09±0.81), followed by death or expecting death (mean=3.01±0.70), 
problems relating to supervisors (mean=2.86±0.81), and dealing with patients and their 
families (mean=2.74±0.82). Experiencing discrimination was the least stressful event 
perceived by the ICU nurses with a mean score of 1.08±1.21. The study findings revealed that 
socio-demographic and occupational determinants of participants (age, marital status, years of 
experience, education level and work schedule) significantly affected their perception of 
stress at work. Conclusion: Job-related stress among ICU nurses reaches values that are 
considered seriously high. Only one factor associated with high levels of job stress appears to 
be modifiable and that factor was work status. Recommendations: This study indicates the 
importance of adopting coping strategies that might help in reducing the amount of stress 
experiencing by the ICU nurses.   

Key words:  job related stress; intensive care unit; nursing stress scale. 
Introduction: 

According to the U.S. National 
Institute of Occupational Safety and 
Health, job stress is the harmful 
physical and emotional responses that 
occur when the requirements of the job 
do not match the capabilities, 
resources, or needs of the employee.(1-

3) It has been identified more 
frequently in jobs low in autonomy but 
high physically and psychologically 
demanding. Nursing has been shown to 
be a strenuous profession, and nurses 
are more exposed to stress-provoking 
factors than other healthcare 
workers.(1)  

The intensive care unit (ICU) has 
been described as an extremely  
stressful environment for nursing 
staff.(4) It is a specialized section of a  

 
 
hospital that provides comprehensive 
and continuous care for critically ill 
patients. Moreover, it is highly 
technological area in which nurses are 
required to make rapid time sensitive 
decisions.(5) For example, the patient’s 
fight for life appears to be an endless 
battle for the nurses working in an 
ICU.(6) Stress is recognized as an 
inherent feature of the work life of ICU 
nurses and they may experience many 
forms of stress, including physical, 
psychological, and moral stress or 
distress.(7) Potential sources of work-
related stress for ICU nurses includes 
providing care to dying patients, lifting 
of heavy unresponsive or emaciated 
patients, fear of making mistakes, high 
workloads /task overload, interpersonal 
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conflict, lack of collaboration, lack of 
support from administration, enclosed 
atmosphere, time pressures, excessive 
noise, unpleasant sights and sounds, 
and standing for long hours.(5,6,8) 
Moreover, nurses working in ICUs 
assume an ever-increasing 
responsibility for the management of 
patient care. In this expanding role, the 
ICU nurses are confronted not only by 
the impending crises of patients and 
families, but also by the demand for 
technologic excellence.(4) 

Stress can adversely affect the 
quality of nursing care delivery, as 
well as having an economic cost to the 
community.(9) Stress may also 
contribute to fatigue; muscle, back and 
joint pain; migraine; hypertension; 
irritable bowel syndrome; duodenal 
ulcer formation; immune disorders; 
obesity and all-cause mortality.(5,10-12) 
Occupational stress and its 
consequences on nurses’ behavior can 
create anxiety, depression, insomnia, 
feelings of inadequacy, reduction of 
attention span, inability to concentrate, 
and impaired decision-making.(13) 
Work related stress has been 
implicated in job dissatisfaction, 
absenteeism, rapid turnover, and 
burnout among nurses. Job stress 
impacts nurses’ health abilities to cope 
with job demands with subsequent 
reduction in the quality and efficacy of 
health service delivery.(14-16) 
 Conversely, the ICU environment 
is also the source of teamwork, 
collaboration, and high control over 
patient care, with an assignment of 1-2 
patients common, compared to 4-10 
patients is settings like the emergency 
department or medical-surgical floor.  
ICU nurses are sometimes viewed as 
more assertive than nurses in other 
settings, resulting in a level of 
engagement at work that may mitigate 
stress by supporting each other in 
caring for difficult patients or dealing 
with difficult situations.(5,6) We 

determined that there was a need to 
understand whether today’s ICU nurses 
perceived their job as a source of stress 
and what factors contributed to stress. 

Significance of study: 
Despite research conducted 

internationally about job-related stress 
in nurses, little has been studied about 
stress among ICU nurses in Egypt. 
Understanding the stress perceptions of 
nurses working in the ICU 
environment is a first step in 
determining whether stress reduction 
need to be considered by hospital and 
health care administrators.(4,15) Thus 
the findings are intended to inform 
nurse educators, nurse mangers, and 
nurse administrators regarding the 
level and types of stressors among ICU 
nurses. 

Aim of the study: 
The aim of this study is to identify 

factors causing stress among nurses 
working in intensive care environment 
in two different Egyptian governorates. 
Research Questions: 
       The following research questions 
are addressed: 

1. What are the factors causing stress 
among nurses working in the 
intensive care environment? 

2. What are the most and least 
perceived sources of stress that 
commonly faced by ICU nurses? 

3. Are there differences in nurses’ 
stressors in the two different 
Egyptian governorates? 

4. Is there relation between level of 
stress and ICU nurses' socio-
demographic and occupational 
characteristics? 

Subjects & Methods: 
Research design:  

A descriptive exploratory design 
was used in this study. This study used 
a survey to collect prospective data at a 
single point in time. 
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Settings: 
      This study was conducted in the 

adult ICUs of four hospitals in two 
Egyptian governorates. Two hospitals 
were in Alexandria: Alexandria Main 
University hospital (the casualty care 
unit "unit I", General ICU "unit III"), 
and Gamal Abd-Elnasser hospital 
(General ICU). Two hospitals in 
Damanhour were also settings for this 
study: Damanhour National Institute 
Hospital including: (General ICU, 
Coronary ICU), and Damanhour Chest 
Hospital: (Chest ICU). 

Subjects: 
 A convenience sample of nurses 
providing direct patient care was 
recruited. All nurses were eligible to 
participate in this study regardless of 
their qualification in nursing if they 
had at least 6 months of working 
experience in the ICU setting. 
Tools: 

The tool used in this study was 
"ICU Nurses’ Work Related Stresses 
Questionnaire". It is adopted and 
modified from French et al.(17) and 
consisted of three parts: 
� Part (1): Elicited  socio-

demographic and occupational 
information about the ICU nurses 
such as " gender; age; years of 
experience in the ICU; 
qualification; current position; work 
schedule; residence; and  mean of 
transportation to the work place".  

� Part (2): Expanded Nursing Stress 
Scale (ENSS):  was self-report 
questionnaire and used to measure 
source and frequency of stress 
perceived by the ICU nurses. (17) The 
ENSS contained 57 items in nine 
subscales which include: death and 
dying (7 items), conflict with 
physicians (5 items), inadequate 
preparation (4 items), problems with 
peers (6 items), problems with 
supervisors (7 items), workload (9 
items), uncertainty concerning 
 

treatment (8 items), patients and  
their families (8 items), and 
discrimination (3 items). 

Scoring system of ENSS:  
The 57 items were arranged in a 5 

point Likert type scale. The offered 
response options were: does not apply 
(0), never stressful (1), occasionally 
stressful (2), frequently stressful (3) 
and extremely stressful (4). The 
response "does not apply" (0) indicated 
that the respondent had never faced the 
situation described by the item, and 
therefore the calculation of the average 
value was performed excluding zero 
values. A total and sub-scale mean 
score can be derived from this 
instrument. The total score provides an 
overall levels of stress and ranges from 
(0- 228) was obtained by adding all the 
scores on 57 items together. There are 
no specific cut scores or published 
average or “normal” scores for ENSS 
to determine level of stress. However, 
higher scores indicate higher levels of 
stress.  
� Part (3): Environmental Stressors: 

was an investigator-developed  
questionnaire to obtain data related 
to environmental stressors (8 
statements) arranged in a 5 point 
Likert scale and its scoring system 
was the same as calculating the total 
ENSS score. 

Content validity and reliability:   
The study questionnaires were 

translated into Arabic before use with 
Egyptian nurses. The tools were 
circulated to 6 experts in the field of 
critical care nursing to test its content 
validity and ascertain that the tools 
were relevant, understood, and 
applicable. Modifications after this 
content review included. Internal 
consistency of the subscales of ENSS 
was assessed by the researcher using 
Cronbach’s alpha for the ENSS, using 
the entire sample. The study tool 
showed high reliability (α=0.93). 
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Pilot study: 
A pilot study was conducted on 

10% of the study sample (15 nurses) 
who were selected randomly and 
excluded from the total sample. The 
pilot study was performed after the 
development of the tool and before 
starting data collection. The aim of the 
pilot study was to determine the 
applicability of the designed tool, the 
time consumed for filling the sheet and 
also to test clarity of the language. 
Accordingly, minor modifications were 
done to improve clarity. No new items 
were added.  

Fieldwork: 
The field work started at the 

beginning of May 2013 and was 
completed by the end of August 2013. 

Data collection: 
Data were collected through 

meeting with ICU nurses who met the 
inclusion criteria at their office during 
break time. First they completed the 
demographic information using "part 
1" of the study tool. Then nurses 
completed the ENSS "part II" of the 
study tool; they were asked to rate their 
perceptions to a list of stressful 
situations using a five- point Likert- 
type scale. Finally the nurses were 
asked to rate their perceptions to a list 
of environmental ICU stressors using 
"part III". Explanations about the 
purpose of the study or how to 
complete the section were repeated 
whenever participants requested them. 
Completing the questionnaires took 
approximately 15-20 min. 
Administrative and ethical wwwwww 
considerations:  
      Approval was obtained from the 
Ethics Committee of the Faculty of 
Nursing at the University of 
Alexandria. Permission to conduct the 
study was provided by the hospital 
authorities after explanation of the aim 
of the study. Nurses were recruited via 
a verbal request that included the 

purpose and nature of the study and 
information that individual responses 
would be confidential and not shared 
with anyone in the workplace. The 
explanation noted that participation 
was voluntary. Researchers ensured 
that names would be protected. The 
nurses were able to stop participation 
and withdraw from the study at any 
time during data collection. 
Statistical analysis: 

Collected data were tabulated and 
statistically analyzed using the 
Statistical Package for Social Science 
(SPSS) version 20. Descriptive 
statistics were used to summarize the 
stressful factors. Factors with the 
highest and lowest scores were then 
identified (categorical variables were 
expressed as number and percentage 
while continuous variables were 
expressed as mean ± standard 
deviation). Differences in stressors 
between the two governorates were 
determined with independent T-tests. 
Chi-square test used to determine the 
level of significance for qualitative 
variables. Finally, relationships 
between stress scores and ICU nurse 
characteristics were assess by One-way 
ANOVA test. P- Values, which were 
less than 0.05, were considered as 
statistically significant, and, less than 
<0.001, were considered as very highly 
statistically significant. 

Results: 
Table (1): Summarized the 

characteristics of the ICU nurse 
participants. One hundred fifty nurses 
were participated in this study (100 
nurses from Alexandria and 50 from 
Damanhour). The highest percent of 
them at Alexandria and Damanhour 
were between 20 year to 39 year. Forty 
seven percent of them in Alexandria 
nurses were between 20 year to 29 
year, while 46% of Damanhour nurses 
were between 30 year to 39 year. Most 
of studied nurses working in either 
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Alexandria or Damanhour were 
females (75% and 78% respectively), 
married (55% and 72% respectively), 
and had working experience ranging 
from 2 to 5 years (50% and 64% 
respectively). In Alexandria, more than 
half (52%) of nurses in the intended 
ICUs had Bachelor of Science in 
nursing while 62% of ICU nurses in 
Damanhour had secondary technical 
nursing school diploma. Most of 
studied nursesin Alexandria (65%) 
were working in general ICUs while 
the majority of studied nurses in 
Damanhour were working in general 
and specialized ICU (48% and 34% 
respectively). It was found that most of 
studied nurses working in either 
Alexandria and Damanhour were 
rotating among shifts (79% and 80% 
respectively), live away from hospital 
(66% and 72% respectively) and had 
no available mean of transportation 
(71% and 78% respectively). It can be 
noted from the same table that the 
distributions of demographic and 
occupational characteristics among 
studied nurses working in the intended 
ICUs in Alexandria and Damanhour 
were comparable and there were no 
significant differences between the 
nurses in Alexandria and the 
Damanhour governorates (p > 0.05) 
were noted except for educational level 
and type of ICU (general versus 
specialized) as noted in Table (1). 

Table (2): Illustrates comparison 
of mean scores for intensity of all 
stress situation categories as perceived 
by ICU nurses in Alexandria and 
Damanhour.  It also lists averaged 
scores separately for each governorate. 
Independent t-tests yielded significant 
differences in nurses’ stress situation-
specific stress scores, comparing the 
two study settings. Note also that 
highly stressful work situations were 
different in the two study settings. 
Nurses at all ICUs in Alexandria rated 
"death or expecting death" as the most 

stressful situation with mean score of 
2.82±0.69 compared to 3.41± 0.51 in 
Damanhour and the differences were 
statistically significant p=0.00. It can 
be noted that the intensity of this stress 
situation in Damanhour is higher than 
its level in Alexandria. However, in 
Damanhour ICU nurses rated situations 
related to working environments as the 
most stressful ones with high mean 
score of 3.95±0.09 compared to 
2.42±0.72 in Alexandria and  also the 
differences were statistically 
significant p=0.00. On the other hand, 
the least stressful event rated by the 
ICU nurses in both (Alexandria and 
Damanhour) was discrimination with 
mean scores of 1.46±1.28 and 
0.31±0.44 respectively. 

Table (3): Indicates rating of 
stress associated with death and dying 
and inadequate emotional preparation. 
On average, nurses' responses to items 
in the death and dying subscale were 
rated as the second stressful event 
occurring in the studied ICUs with 
relatively high total mean score 
(3.01±0.70). The death of a patient 
with whom ICU nurses developed a 
close relationship was rated as an 
extremely stressful situation among the 
majority (74.7%) of participants with 
mean score of (3.52±0.96). It was 
found that feeling inadequately 
prepared to help with the emotional 
needs of a patient was rated as 
frequently to extremely stressful event 
among more than half of studied ICU 
nurses with a mean score of 
2.493±1.16. 

Table (4): Illustrates rating of 
stress associated with conflict with 
physicians and problems with peers. 
About 38% of nurses indicated that 
criticism by a physician was extremely 
stressful with mean score of 2.96±1.04. 
This score was followed by conflict 
with a physician and having to 
organize doctors' work with mean 
scores of 2.66±1.26 and 2.18±1.27 
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respectively. Concerning problems 
with peers, 46% of the ICU nurse 
participants revealed lack of opportunity 
to share experiences and feelings with 
other personnel in the work setting was 
a frequently occurring stressful 
situation.  

Table (5): Demonstrates rating of 
stress associated with problems 
relating to supervisors and workload. 
The ICU nurses' responses revealed 
that being held accountable for things 
over which they have no control was 
considered extremely stressful 
situation among the majority (60.7%) 
of them with a relatively high mean 
score (3.22±1.14). It was found that 
workload was perceived by the studied 
ICU nurses as the first stressful events 
with a relatively high mean score 
(3.09±0.81). Having to make decisions 
under pressure and having to work 
through breaks were extremely 
stressful events as perceived by more 
than half of ICU nurses. In this 
subscale not enough staff to adequately 
cover the unit and unpredictable 
staffing and scheduling were also rated 
as extremely stressful events occurring 
in the work place among (48.7%) and 
(48.0%) of ICU nurses respectively. 

Table (6): Represents rating of 
stress associated with uncertainty 
concerning treatment and dealing with 
patients and their families. Regarding 
uncertainty concerning treatment, 
nurses' responses indicate that the 
majority of items in this subscale were 
frequently to extremely stressful to 
them. In particular fear of making a 
mistake in treating a patient was rated 
as extremely stressful situation to 
(56.0%) of nurses worked in the 
intended ICUs with a mean score of 
(3.15±1.14). Also a physician not 
being present in a medical emergency 
was rated as an extremely stressful 
event by (50.0%) of nurses in the 
whole study sample. In relation to 
dealing with patients and their families, 

items within this subscale were rated as 
the fifth stressful events occurring to 
studied nurses. Patient making 
unreasonable demands was rated as 
frequently to extremely stressful event 
by (57.4%) of nurses. Being blamed 
for anything that goes wrong was 
ranked as next most stressful event 
followed by being the one that has to 
deal with patients' families with mean 
scores of 2.90±1.17 and 2.87±1.18 
respectively. 

Table (7): Represents rating of 
stress associated with discrimination 
and ICU environment. Studied nurses 
responses indicate situations of being 
discriminated were ranked as the least 
stressful event with a mean score of 
(1.08±1.21). In particular experiencing 
discrimination on the basis of sex was 
the most frequently occurring stressful 
event in the workplace. The least 
occurring stressful event rated by the 
CCNs was being sexually harassed 
with a mean score of (0.88±1.28). 
Regarding ICU environment, nurses' 
responses indicate ICU environment as 
the third stressful experience with a 
total mean score of (2.91±0.95). In 
particular, noise exposure "beeping and 
buzzing sounds of machines", 
insufficient equipment and enclosed 
atmosphere were rated as the most 
frequently occurring stressful 
conditions with high mean scores of 
(3.11±1.15, 3.01±1.12 and 3.00±1.20 
respectively). While, irritant gases 
exposure was the least stressful 
experience mentioned by the studied 
nurses although this still had a high 
mean score (2.75±1.37)  on the scale 
ranging from 0-4. 

Table (8): Shows relation between 
ICU nurses’ socio-demographic and 
occupational characteristics and total 
mean of ENSS. Regarding socio-
demographic characteristics, the results 
of the current study revealed that ICU 
nurses in the age less than 30 years had 
the highest score on ENSS 
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(157.01±32.59). On the other hand, 
nurses in the age group 40 years to less 
than 50 years had the lower score on 
ENSS scale (135.68±33.79). The 
differences between nurses' age and 
stress were statistically significant (F= 
3.887, P=0.010). The displayed 
findings also reveal that female nurses 
had the highest ENSS mean score 
(152.72±28.00) as compared to male 
nurses (144.29±36.10), but the 
differences were not statistically 
significant (t=1.402, P= 0.163).  

It can be noted from the same table 
that single nurses had lower ENSS 
mean score (141.06±39.32) than 
married nurses (157.97±19.84) and the 
differences were highly statistically 
significant (t=3.371, P= 0.001). In 
addition, nurses who had children had 
higher ENSS mean score 
(155.45±18.65) than those who had not 
(145.78±39.52) and the differences 
were statistically significant (t=1.984, 
P= 0.049). The findings of the present 
study revealed that there was a 
statistically significant relation 
between ENSS mean scores and 
nurses’ level of education (F=6.062, 
P= 0.003). The ICU nurses who had 
diploma degree had higher ENSS mean 
score (158.59±21.35) than nurses who 
had bachelor (146.55±33.20). The 
displayed findings also revealed that 
nurses with less experience have the 
highest stress mean score 
(157.18±35.19) than those who have 
experience more than 5 years 
(138.54±32.38). There is a statistically 
significant relation between nurse's 
stress and working experience 
(F=4.644, P=0.011). 

Concerning ICU nurses’ 
occupational characteristics; it can be 
noted from the same table (Table 8) 
that there is a statistical significant 
difference between the type of hospital 
and ICU nurses’ stress (F=3.134, 
P=.027). The results points out that 
ICU nurses’ stress increased among 

nurses working in the university 
hospitals (157.54±31.62) than nurses 
working in ministry of health and 
health insurance hospitals 
(157.10±08.26 and 147.75±36.89 
respectively). The study findings 
 revealed that there was a statistical 
significant difference between the type 
of ICUs and nurses’ stress level 
(F=7.349, P=.000). It was observed 
that nurses working in the CCU had 
the lower ENSS mean score 
(130.25±41.63) than those working in 
SICU, GICU and specialized ICU 
(147.00±26.21, 156.64±25.16 and 
158.76±3.50 respectively). It can be 
observed that ENSS mean score 
increased among nurses who were 
staying away from the workplace 
(152.06±28.78) than nurses staying 
near to workplace (147.42±33.58) but 
the differences are not statistically 
significant. The findings of the current 
study also revealed that ENSS mean 
score was increased among nurses who 
had not a mean of transportation to 
workplace (151.61±29.35) than nurses 
who had (149.81±29.35) but the 
differences were not statistically 
significant. The displayed findings also 
revealed that nurses who were working 
in the rotating shifts had the highest 
ENSS mean score (153.09±29.78) than 
those working only in morning shift 
(139.30±28.50). There was a 
statistically significant relation 
between nurse's stress and working 
schedule (t=2.056, P=0.042).  

Discussion: 
The complex environment of an 

intensive care unit is associated with a 
considerable amount of stress. High 
levels of stress among ICU nurses have 
been documented in numerous studies. 
(18-20) The current study revealed that 
ICU nurses in the two Egyptian 
governorates have been frequently, and 
in some case, excessively exposed to 
stressful situations as a part of their 
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daily work. The most intense stressors 
for nurses worked in both Alexandria 
and Damanhour ICUs were related to 
workload followed by, emotional 
issues related to death and dying, 
problems relating to supervisors and 
dealing with patients and their families. 
These factors were reported 
previously. (21,22) 

The results of the current study 
revealed that workload was the first 
most common source of nursing stress 
as perceived by the ICU nurses. This 
may be attributed to the fact that Egypt 
as many other countries, suffers from a 
shortage of nurses, which increases the 
workload for nurses. Also, ICU nurses 
burdened with extra responsibilities 
such as having too many non-nursing 
tasks and having to work through 
breaks. It was found during the present 
study that the nurse to patient's ratio in 
Damanhour ICUs was 1:2 for the 
morning shift, 1:3 for both afternoon 
and night shifts. Nursing shortage in 
Damanhour ICUs was more than its 
level in Alexandria ICUs. Many nurses 
in Damanhour ICUs reported that there 
was not enough staff to get the work 
done, and that this resulted in not 
having enough time to provide 
emotional support to the patient and to 
respond to patient's needs. Many also 
believed that they could deliver much 
better care if they had more enough 
time with each patient. The current 
shortages of nurses will thus continue 
to challenge the ability of nurses to 
meet the needs of their patients, 
thereby potentially providing a 
situation where level of work stress 
increases and work satisfaction 
decreases.  

The present study agrees with the 
findings obtained by Gillespie (23) and 
Astbury (24) who reported that the most 
ICU stressors were resulting from 
inadequate staffing. Another study that 
was carried out in Saudi Arabia on 148 
 

 nurses found that lack of enough staff 
was the most stressful event perceived 
by staff nurses. (25) Similarly, in a study 
carried out in a Chinese intensive care 
unit, excessive workload was the most 
frequently cited sources of workplace 
stress; this was a result of the nursing 
shortage with fewer nurses to care for 
more patients.(26) It is documented that 
excessive nursing workloads adversely 
affect the safety of patients. 
Montgomery (27) has demonstrated that 
excessive workloads will have a 
significant effect on the incidence of 
medical errors that compromise the 
safety and even the lives of patient. 
Furthermore heavy nursing workload 
increases the incidence of burnout and 
its related disorders in nurses and their 
private and professional lives.(28) 

Regarding issues related to death 
and dying, the results of the current 
study revealed that death and dying 
was the second most common source 
of stress the ICU nurses face in their 
work. This may be attributed to the 
increased workload, nurses may not 
have enough time to support each 
other’s emotions in general and those 
emotions related to death and dying in 
particular. Also, it may be due to the 
fact that nurses traditionally had not 
received sufficient education about 
dealing with death/dying so they do not 
know how to express their emotions 
when encountering the death or the 
dying of a patient. This idea supported 
by Mallory (29) and Mok et al.(30)  who 
indicated that nurses' attitudes toward 
care of dying were improved after the 
implementation of educational 
programs in palliative care. Nurses 
have benefited from the programs in 
the areas of change in attitudes, 
increased self-awareness, having a 
positive attitude towards death and 
dying and acquiring the knowledge and 
psychosocial skills in providing 
culturally sensitive care for dying 
patients. 
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The finding of the current study is 
in parallel with the previous studies in 
the Arab world that have been carried 
out to investigate stress in the nursing 
profession. Umro (22) studied stress and 
coping mechanism among nurses in 
Palestinian hospitals and found that 
death and dying the most reported 
source of stress in nursing. Also 
Muhammad (31) and Hamaideh et al. (32) 
reported that nurses working in ICUs  
in Egypt and Jordan perceived death or 
expecting death situations as the 
highest source of stress they face in 
their work. Several other studies in 
Asia and Europe investigated stress 
among nurses and have found similar 
findings with regard to sources of 
stress. A study examined work 
stressors and ways of coping among 
hospitals from Japan, South Korea, 
Thailand and the United States 
(Hawaii) suggested that nurses in all 
four countries ranked workload and 
dealing with death and dying to be the 
highest of all workplace stressors. (33) 
On the contrary, the present study 
findings did not agree with another 
study done by Hays et al.(34) who found 
that the studied nurses reported 
minimum to no stress most frequently 
with exposure to death and dying. 

Concerning ICU environment as a 
stress factor, the current study revealed 
that the most stressful items related to 
ICU environment reported by the 
studied nurses were exposure to noise, 
insufficient functional equipment, 
enclosed atmosphere, and exposure to 
radiation. Exposure to noise may be 
attributed to absence of regular 
maintenance of ICU machines which 
leads to inappropriate beeping and 
buzzing sounds of machines or may be 
due to nurse's delay in response to 
machines alarms. Exposure to radiation 
was frequent stressor in the studied 
ICUs. This may be related to the fact, 
that inadequate safety measures such 
as inadequately shielded nurses when 

holding patient in proper position for 
radiation make them liable to have 
radiation hazards. In addition, the 
present study found that lack of 
sufficient or malfunctioning equipment 
was common stressor. The results of 
the present study are consistent with 
the finding obtained by Mohamed et 
al.(35) who studied nurses' stresses in 
pediatric ICU and found insufficient 
functional equipment, exposure to 
radiation and exposure to noise 
generated during the use of medical 
equipment were the most common 
environmental stressor reported by 
staff nurses.  Similarly, Al Omar (36) 
reported that the first cause of work 
stress in nursing was the insufficient 
technical facilities. 

Not surprisingly, the lack of support 
by nursing administration was 
perceived as stressful situation by the 
ICU nurses in the present study with a 
relatively high mean score. This may 
be attributed to culturally; Egyptian 
nurses look to supervisors highly. 
One’s supervisor is considered in a 
position of authority and therefore able 
to help in problem solving. When such 
help is unavailable or perceived as 
inadequate, the level of stress may be 
perceived higher. This is in agreement 
with Andal (37) who reported that a 
problem with supervisors was 
perceived as most stressful to studied 
nurses. 

Issues of dealing with patients and 
their families, also commonly provided 
a sources of stress to ICU nurses. The 
present findings indicated that "patient 
making unreasonable demands and 
being blamed for anything that goes 
wrong" was rated as frequently to 
extremely stressful events by ICU 
nurses. This could be attributed to the 
fact that working with patients, 
families and visitors seem to cause 
excessive workload because nurses 
must provide psychological support 
and/or respond to their dissatisfaction 
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or complaints which increased 
pressures on the daily routine of care. 
Assigning “Blame” to the nurse is 
counterproductive but is the usual 
practice in many patient care units. 
Nursing managers should be 
particularly astute to look at causes of 
problems to solve them rather than 
“assigning blame”. This finding is 
consistent with Andal (37) and Damit 
(38) who found that patient and family 
stressors were perceived as most 
stressful events perceived by the staff 
nurses.  

In relation to uncertainty about 
treatment associated with nurse's 
performance, it was reported to be 
among the highest stressors by nurses 
in the current study. The findings of 
the present study illustrated that fear of 
making a mistake in treating a patient 
was among the most extremely 
stressful situation to nurses working in 
the studied ICUs. This might be due to 
inadequate preparation of ICU nurses 
to deal with critically ill patients. Also, 
it might be related to inadequate 
information from a physician regarding 
patient's medical condition. In 
Damanhour ICUs the nurses had 
reported that they did not receive any 
in-service training or adequately 
prepared to deal with critically ill 
patients. Their lack of knowledge 
frustrated them, as they felt they were 
not able to provide efficient care and 
give patients correct information. Also 
inadequate training on what they have 
to do give the feeling of insecurity. 
This is supported by Alnems et al.(39) 
who reported that the most stressful 
subscale for staff nurses was the 
uncertainty concerning treatment.  
Likewise, Muhammad (31) also reported 
uncertainty about treatment associated 
with nurse's performance as one of the 
highest stressors by ICU nurses. The 
present study is inconsistent with 
Payne (40) who found that the least 

frequently problematic stressor was 
uncertainty concerning treatment. 

In relation to inadequate emotional 
preparation, more than half of studied 
nurses rated "feeling inadequately 
prepared to help with the emotional 
needs of a patient" as frequently to 
extremely stressful event. This may be 
attributed to the totality of a patient 
care delivery system; there is a 
tremendous importance on the 
completion of routine procedures in an 
almost mechanistic fashion. Also, 
setting nursing objectives as physical 
objectives and avoid the emotional 
objectives in their job and that’s 
opposing the philosophy of holistic 
care in nursing and converting the 
nurses into machines regarding the 
performance of their work. So, it is 
indeed time of care for ICU nurses and 
the time to look for the main stressors 
and reducing it to achieve the concept 
of holistic care in nursing (the 
physical, emotional, social and 
spiritual aspect of care). The finding of 
the current study is in parallel with 
Milutinović et al. (41) study who 
documented that there is a focus on 
compliance with policies and 
procedures rather than emotional 
aspect of care. 

In relation to conflict with 
physician, the present study revealed 
that criticism by a physician was the 
frequently stressful situation for the 
studied ICU nurses. Negative 
perception of one’s work or how the 
staff nurse interacts with the physician 
in the work setting is an important 
variable in stress level rating. It can 
only be surmised that in a situation 
where a physician is unavailable, the 
nurse is forced to make a prudent 
decision, then a criticism results from 
such action resulting in a no-win 
situation. A nurse has to work under 
such circumstances and maintain 
professional composure. Such  
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scenarios occurring repeatedly could 
possibly influence a nurse’s decision to 
leave the source of stress, in this case 
may be request transfer to a different 
unit to avoid the physician in question. 
Some may chose to leave the hospital 
altogether. This is in agreement with 
other studies done by Umro (22) and 
Milutinovićet al. (41) who studied stress 
among ICU nurses in Palestinian 
hospitals and Serbia. 

The study findings revealed that 
socio-demographic and occupational 
determinants of participants (age, marital 
status, years of experience, education level 
and work schedule) significantly affect 
their perception of stress at work. It was 
found that the younger nurses with less 
than 2 years' experience were more 
stressed than other the older nurses 
with more than 5 years' experience. 
This may be attributed to once the 
nurse has the knowledge and skill 
acquired; the degree of stress is 
reduced. Other explanations for the 
high stress level: most of participants 
in this study were women. Generally, 
women are found to have more 
psychological strains and depression 

(42), experience greater sadness and 
anxiety (43), and women might be more 
vulnerable to repeated stress exposures 

(44). Also, in Egypt society the majority 
of young women do not view nursing 
as socially-appropriate career choice. 
So, prevailing negative images and 
perceived low status of nursing have 
contributed to the high stress level of 
ICU nurses. 

Many studies have shown that an 
individual nurse may behave quite 
differently in stress perceiving 
according to their gender, age, marital 
status, working experience and 
educational level. Raja(45) reported that 
there was a significant relation 
between nurses' experience and level 
of stress. Similarly, Milutinović et al. 
(41) underlined that; socio-demographic 
determinants of participants 

significantly affect their perception of 
stress at work. Contrary to the results 
of the current study, Alnems et al. (39) 
and Al Hosis et al.(46) found that there 
were no statistically significant 
relations among total mean of working 
stress, gender, age, shift rotation, 
educational level and work place. In 
the same line Saudi study conducted by 
Al-Omar (36) revealed that work stress 
was not influenced by the educational 
level, the gender, the marital status, the 
language of the employee. wwwwww 
Conclusion:  

The current study documents 
reported stress by ICU nurses was high 
enough to be considered serious. The 
most intense and frequently reported 
sources of stress perceived by ICU 
nurses was workload followed by 
emotional issues related to death and 
dying, problems relating to supervisors 
and dealing with patients and their 
families.  The least frequently reported 
stressful event was discrimination. The 
present study also revealed that socio-
demographic and occupational 
determinants of participants (age, 
marital status, years of experience, 
education level and work schedule) 
significantly affected work-related 
stress.  

Recommendations:  
The following recommendations 

are suggested; 
� ICU nurses need to be trained 

through a stress-management 
program to equip them with 
advances in knowledge, as well 
as required skills, which helping 
nurses to cope with stress at 
work. 

� Creating opportunities for ICU 
nurses to attend in-service 
education as well as enhancing 
continuing education. This will 
update them about new 
diagnostic and treatment 
modalities; handling modern 
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equipment; and the optimal use 
of supplies. 

� The results provide evidence to 
support the integration of 
palliative care in undergraduate 
critical care nursing practice to 
increase positive attitudes toward 
care for the dying. 

� Moreover, researchers 
recommend to foster 
cooperation, social interaction 
concepts, and effective coping 
mechanism among 
undergraduate critical care 
nursing students for future 
behaviors. Students who learn 
the importance of cooperation 
and social integration during 
their education might better 
understand the significance of 
coworker support in the work 
place. 

� Psychological counseling after 
stressful events (i.e. debriefing 
sessions) should be an integral 
service to help supporting ICU 
nurses experiencing high levels 
of stress 

� Policies that reduce stress from 
shift work should be developed. 
These could include reducing the 
number of hours of the night 
shift, increasing rest time 
between shifts, providing 
adequate meal times, and 
providing a fair distribution of 
weekend and holiday work. 
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Table (1): Percent distribution of ICU nurses according to their socio-demographic  
                 and occupational characteristics in Alexandria and Damanhour (N=150) 

 

Socio-demographic characteristics 

Alexandria  
N=100 

Damanhour  
N=50 

 

Test  
P value n (%) n (%) 

Age : 
� 20-29 

 
47 

 
(47) 

 
16 

 
(32) 

 

 
� 30-39 33 (33) 23 (46) 2= 4.065 

P= .255 � 40-49 17 (17) 8 (16) 
� 40-≤60 3 (0.3) 3 (0.6) 

Sex:  
� Female 

 
75 

 
(75) 

 
39 

 
(78) 

2= 0.164 
P= 0.685 

� Male 25 (25) 11 (22) 
Marital Status: 

� Single 
 

39 
 

(39) 
 

10 
 

(20) 
 5.772 =2ݔ
P= 0.123 

� Married 55 (55) 36 (72) 
� Divorced 2 (0.2) 2 (0.4) 
� Widow 4 (0.4) 2 (0.4) 

Years of experience: 
� Less than 2 years                       

 
9 

 
(9) 

 
2 

 
 3.042 =2ݔ (0.4)

P= 0.218 
� 2-5 years 50 (50) 32 (64) 
� More than 5 years 41 (41) 16 (32) 

Level of education: 
� STNS Diploma1 

38 (38) 31 (62) 

 10.554 =2ݔ
P= 0.014* 

� THI Diploma2 10 (10) 0 (0.0) 
� BSc Nursing3 52 (52) 19 (38) 

Work place:  
� GICU  

 
65 

 
(65) 

 
24 

 
(48) 

 42.774 =2ݔ
P= 0.000* 

� CCU  21 (21) 9 (18) 
� SICU 14 (14) 0 (0.0) 
� Specialized ICU 0 (0.0) 17 (34) 

Work schedule: 
� Morning 

 0.020 =2ݔ (20) 10 (21) 21
P= 0.887 

� Rotating 79 (79) 40 (80) 
Residence: 

� Away from work 
 0.551 =2ݔ (72) 36 (66) 66

P= 0.458 
� Near to work 34 (34) 14 (28) 

Transportation: 
� Available  

 
29 

 
(29) 

 
11 

 
 0.835 =2ݔ (22)

P= 0.361 � Not available 71 (71) 39 (78) 

STNS Diploma1: Secondary Technical Nursing School Diploma, 
THI Diploma2: Technical Health Institute Diploma,  
BSc Nursing3: Bachelor of Science in Nursing. 
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Table (2): Comparison of mean scores for intensity of all stress situation  
                     categories as perceived by ICU nurses in Alexandria and Damanhour  

 

Stress Situation Categories 
Alexandria  
Mean± SD 

Damanhour  
Mean± SD t. test  (p value) 

ENSS1 subscales:    

� Death and dying  (7 items) 2.82±0.69 3.41± 0.51 5.36 (0.00) 

� Conflict with physicians  (5 items) 2.49±0.85 1.89±0.87 4.00 (0.00) 

� Inadequate preparation (4 items) 2.51±0.85 2.11± 0.53 3.06 (0.00) 

� Problems with peers (6 items) 2.45±0.73 1.82±0.58 5.21 (0.00) 

� Problems with supervisors (7 items) 2.68±0.91 3.22±0.34 4.03 (0.00) 

� Workload  (9 items) 2.72±0.71 3.85±0.32 10.64 (0.00) 

� Uncertainty concerning treatment (8 items) 2.68±0.94 2.85±0.43 1.22  (0.22) 

� Patients and their families (8 items) 2.71±0.90 2.82±0.60 0.79  (0.430) 

� Discrimination (3 items) 1.46±1.28 0.31±0.44 6.11  (0.00) 

Other Stress Dimension: 
� Environment  stressors (9 items) 2.42±0.72 3.95±0.09 

 

14.90 (0.00) 

ENSS1: Expended Nursing Stress Scale 
Significant values at the p≤ 0.05 
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         Table (3): Rating of Stress Associated with Death and Dying and Inadequate Emotional Preparation 

 

 Stress Situation Categories 

Doesn’t 
Apply 

Never Stressful Occasionally 
Stressful 

Frequently 
Stressful 

Extremely 
Stressful Mean± SD 

n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%)  

Death and Dying Subscale 
1. Performing procedures that patients experience 

as painful  0 (0.0) 13 (8.7) 43 (28.7) 27 (18.0) 67 (44.7) 2.98±1.04 

2. Feeling helpless in the case of a patient who 
fails to improve 0 (0.0) 21 (14.0) 29 (19.3) 40 (26.7) 60 (40.0) 2.92±1.07 

3. Listening or talking to a patient about his/her 
approaching death   2 (1.3) 19 (12.7) 32 (21.3) 21 (14.0) 76 (50.7) 3.00±1.16 

4. The death of a patient 0 (0.0) 3 (2.0) 25 (16.7) 29 (19.3) 93 (62.0) 3.41±0.83 
5. The death of a patient with whom you 

developed a close relationship 5 (3.3) 1 (0.7) 17 (11.3) 15 (10.0) 11
2 

(74.7) 3.52±0.96 

6. Physician(s) not being present when a patient 
dies 11 (7.3) 6 (4.0) 30 (20.0) 52 (34.7) 51 (34.0) 2.84±1.15 

7. Watching a patient suffer   4 (2.7) 32 (21.3) 30 (20.0) 61 (40.7) 23 (15.3) 2.44±1.07 
Total mean 3.01±0.70 

Inadequate Emotional Preparation Subscale 
1. Feeling inadequately prepared to help with 

emotional needs of patient's family 4 (2.7) 25 (16.7) 74 (49.3) 32 (21.3) 15 (10.0) 2.19±0.92 

2. Being asked a question by a patient for which I 
do not have a satisfactory answer 4 (2.7) 17 (11.3) 61 (40.7) 42 (28.0) 26 (17.3) 2.46±0.99 

3. Feeling inadequately prepared to help with the 
emotional needs of a patient 8 (5.3) 22 (14.7) 44 (29.3) 40 (26.7) 36 (24.0) 2.493±1.16 

Total mean 2.38±0.78 

Scale:  Doesn’t Apply= 0, Never Stressful= 1, Occasionally Stressful=2, Frequently Stressful=3, Extremely Stressful=4
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 Table (4): Rating of Stress Associated with Conflict with Physicians and Problems with Peers 

Stress Situation Categories Doesn’t 
 Apply 

Never 
Stressful 

Occasionally 
Stressful 

Frequently 
Stressful 

Extremely 
Stressful Mean± SD 

n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%)  

Conflict with Physicians Subscale 
1. Criticism by a physician 6 (4.0) 4 (2.7) 37 (24.7) 46 (30.7) 57 (38.0) 2.96±1.04 
2. Conflict with a physician 11 (7.3) 20 (13.3) 28 (18.7) 41 (27.3) 50 (33.3) 2.66±1.26 
3. Disagreement concerning the treatment of a patient 44 (29.3) 14 (9.3) 39 (26.0) 29 (19.3) 24 (16.0) 1.83±1.44 

4. Making a decision concerning a patient when the 
physician is unavailable 39 (26.0) 8 (5.3) 56 (37.3) 36 (24.0) 11 (7.3) 1.81±1.26 

5. Having to organize doctors' work 25 (16.7) 9 (6.0) 54 (36.0) 37 (24.7) 25 (16.7) 2.18±1.27 
Total mean 2.29±0.90 

Problems with Peers Subscale 
1. Lack of opportunity to talk openly with other 

personnel about problems in the work setting 
6 (4.0) 24 (16.0) 43 (28.7) 55 (36.7) 22 (14.7) 2.42±1.05 

2. Lack of opportunity to share experiences and 
feelings with other personnel in the work setting 

7 (4.7) 23 (15.3) 29 (19.3) 69 (46.0) 22 (14.7) 2.50±1.06 

3. Lack of an opportunity to express to other personnel 
on the unit my negative feelings towards patients 

6 (4.0) 27 (18.0) 76 (50.7) 21 (14.0) 20 (13.3) 2.14±0.99 

4. Difficulty in working with a particular nurse outside 
my immediate work setting 

17 (11.3) 10 (6.7) 56 (37.3) 43 (28.7) 24 (16.0) 2.31±1.16 

5. Difficulty in working with a particular nurse in my 
immediate work setting 

17 (11.3) 25 (16.7) 50 (33.3) 33 (22.0) 25 (16.7) 2.16±1.22 

6. Difficulty in working with nurses of the opposite sex 22 (14.7) 16 (10.7) 82 (54.7) 15 (10.0) 15 (10.0) 1.90±1.09 

Total mean 2.24±0.75 

Scale:  Doesn’t Apply= 0, Never Stressful= 1, Occasionally Stressful=2, Frequently Stressful=3, Extremely Stressful=4 
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  Table (5): Rating of Stress Associated with Problems Relating to Supervisors and Workload 

Stress Situation Categories Doesn’t 
Apply 

Never 
Stressful 

Occasionally 
Stressful 

Frequently 
Stressful 

Extremely 
Stressful 

Mean± SD 

n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%)  
Problems Relating to Supervisors Subscale 
1. Conflict with a supervisor 12 (8.0) 18 (12.0) 64 (42.7) 39 (26.0) 17 (11.3) 2.20±1.05 
2. Lack of support from my immediate supervisor 9 (6.0) 1 (0.7) 64 (42.7) 39 (26.0) 37 (24.7) 2.62±1.05 
3. Lack of support by nursing administrators 9 (6.0) 3 (2.0) 48 (32.0) 44 (29.3) 46 (30.7) 2.76±1.09 
4. Lack of support from health care administrators 8 (5.3) 3 (2.0) 43 (28.7) 34 (22.7) 62 (41.3) 2.92±1.12 
5. Criticism by a supervisor 5 (3.3) 7 (4.7) 33 (22.0) 26 (17.3) 79 (52.7) 3.11±1.10 
6. Being held accountable for things over which I have no 

control 
7 (4.7) 7 (4.7) 22 (14.7) 23 (15.3) 91 (60.7) 3.22±1.14 

7. Criticism by nursing administration 3 (2.0) 9 (6.0) 26 (17.3) 32 (21.3) 80 (53.3) 3.18±1.04 
Total mean  2.86±0.81 

Workload Subscale 
1. Unpredictable staffing and scheduling 2 (1.3) 9 (6.0) 23 (15.3) 44 (29.3) 72 (48.0) 3.16±.98 

2. Not enough time to provide emotional support to the patient 8 (5.3) 6 (4.0) 32 (21.3) 37 (24.7) 67 (44.7) 2.99±1.14 
3. Not enough time to complete all of my tasks 6 (4.0) 8 (5.3) 20 (13.3) 45 (30.0) 71 (47.3) 3.11±1.08 
4. Too many non-nursing tasks required, such as clerical work 2 (1.3) 4 (2.7) 29 (19.3) 46 (30.7) 69 (46.0)     3.17±0.92 
5. Not enough time to respond to the needs of patients' families 6 (4.0) 4 (2.7) 40 (26.7) 33 (22.0) 67 (44.7) 3.00±1.08 
6. Not enough staff to adequately cover the unit 6 (4.0) 7 (4.7) 23 (15.3) 41 (27.3) 73 (48.7) 3.12±1.08 
7. Demands of patient classification system 10 (6.7) 9 (6.0) 33 (22.0) 30 (20.0) 68 (45.3) 2.91±1.23 
8. Having to work through breaks 3 (2.0) 6 (4.0) 25 (16.7) 40 (26.7) 76 (50.7) 3.20±0.98 
9. Having to make decisions under pressure 5 (3.3) 3 (2.0) 25 (16.7) 41 (27.3) 76 (50.7) 3.20±1.010 

Total mean  3.09±0.81 
Scale:  Doesn’t Apply= 0, Never Stressful= 1, Occasionally Stressful=2, Frequently Stressful=3, Extremely Stressful=4 
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Table (6): Rating of Stress Associated with Uncertainty Concerning Treatment and Dealing with Patients and Their Families 

Stress Situation Categories Doesn’t Apply Never Stressful Occasionally 
Stressful 

Frequently 
Stressful 

Extremely 
Stressful Mean± SD 

n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%)
Uncertainty Concerning Treatment Subscale 

1. Inadequate information from a physician regarding 
the medical condition of a patient 

9 (6.0) 17 (11.3) 47 (31.3) 43 (28.7) 34 (22.7) 2.50±1.13 

2. A physician ordering what appears to be 
inappropriate treatment for a patient 

19 (12.7) 27 (18.0) 16 (10.7) 40 (26.7) 48 (32.0) 2.83±1.44 

3. Fear of making a mistake in treating a patient 6 (4.0) 9 (6.0) 25 (16.7) 26 (17.3) 84 (56.0) 3.15±1.14 
4. A physician not being present in emergency 11 (7.3) 2 (1.3) 32 (21.3) 30 (20.0) 75 (50.0) 3.04±1.19 
5. Not knowing what a patient or a patient's family 

ought to be told about the patient's condition  
13 (8.7) 22  (14.7) 36 (24.0) 21 (14.0) 58 (38.7) 2.59±1.35 

6. Being exposed to health and safety hazards 21 (14.0) 8 (5.3) 20 (13.3) 27 (18.0) 74 (49.3) 2.83±1.44 
7. Uncertainty regarding the operation and functioning 

of specialized equipment 
10 (6.7) 8 (5.3) 46 (30.7) 28 (18.7) 58 (38.7) 2.77±1.21 

8. Feeling inadequately trained for what I have to do 9 (6.0) 6 (4.0) 50 (33.3) 40 (26.7) 45 (30.0) 2.70±1.12 
9. Being in charge with inadequate experience 8 (5.3) 19 (12.7) 36 (24.0) 54 (36.0) 33 (22.0) 2.56±1.12 

Total mean 2.73±0.81 
Dealing with Patients and Their Families Subscale 

1. Patients' families making unreasonable demands 5 (3.3) 4 (2.7) 37 (24.7) 51 (34.0) 53 (35.3) 2.64±1.01 
2. Patients making unreasonable demands 8 (5.3) 4 (2.7) 52 (34.7) 55 (36.7) 31 (20.7) 2.95±1.00 
3. Being blamed for anything that goes wrong 13 (8.7) 2 (1.3) 27 (18.0) 53 (35.3) 55 (36.7) 2.90±1.17 
4. Being the one that has to deal with patients' families 11 (7.3) 4 (2.7) 38 (25.3) 37 (24.7) 60 (40.0) 2.87±1.18 
5. Having to deal with violent patients 12 (8.0) 20 (13.3) 40 (26.7) 38 (25.3) 40 (26.7) 2.58±1.23 
6. Having to deal with abusive patients 9 (6.0) 22 (14.7) 38 (25.3) 34 (22.7) 47 (31.3) 2.49±1.24 
7. Having to deal with abuse from patients' families 8 (5.3) 4 (2.7) 56 (37.3) 34 (22.7) 48 (32.0) 2.73±1.10 
8. Not knowing whether patients' families will report 

you for inadequate care 
10 (6.7) 4 (2.7) 32 (21.3) 65 (43.3) 39 (26.0) 2.793±1.07 

Total mean 2.74±0.82 

Scale:  Doesn’t Apply= 0, Never Stressful= 1, Occasionally Stressful=2, Frequently Stressful=3, Extremely Stressful=4
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Table (7):  Rating of Stress Associated with Discrimination and ICU Environment 

 

Stress Situation Categories Doesn’t Apply Never Stressful Occasionally 
Stressful 

Frequently 
Stressful 

Extremely 
Stressful Mean± SD  

n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%) n (%)  
Discrimination Subscale 

1. Being sexually harassed 93 (62.0) 12 (8.0) 22 (14.7) 15 (10.0) 8 (5.3) 0.88±1.28 
2. Experiencing discrimination because of race or 

ethnicity 
101 (67.3) 9 (6.0) 17 (11.3) 15 (10.0) 8 (5.3) 0.80±1.27 

3. Experiencing discrimination on the basis of sex 79 (52.7) 4 (2.7) 7 (4.7) 25 (16.7) 35 (23.3) 1.55±1.74 
Total mean 1.08±1.21 

ICU Environment Subscale 
1. Closed atmosphere " absence of natural light &air" 9 (6.0) 3 (2.0) 44 (29.3) 16 (10.7) 78 (52.0) 3.00±1.20 
2. Insufficient equipment 3 (2.0) 10 (6.7) 46 (30.7) 14 (9.3) 77 (51.3) 3.01±1.12 
3. Radiation exposure 16 (10.7) 10 (6.7) 27 (18.0) 29 (19.3) 68 (45.3) 2.82±1.35 
4. Irritant gases exposure 17 (11.3) 7 (4.7) 41 (27.3) 16 (10.7) 69 (46.0) 2.75±1.37 
5. Noise exposure "Beeping and buzzing sounds of 

machines" 6 (4.0) 10 (6.7) 25 (16.7) 29 (19.3) 80 (53.3) 3.11±1.15 
6. Insufficient work space. 10 (6.7) 7 (4.7) 34 (22.7) 31 (20.7) 68 (45.3) 2.93±1.21 
7. Being found a scapegoat for disconnected machinery, 

non-working plugs and dislodging endotracheal tubes 12 (8.0) 16 (10.7) 28 (18.7) 26 (17.3) 68 (45.3) 2.81±1.32 
8. Switching off of life support machines for patients 

with brain death or at the end of life 
10 (6.7) 3 (2.0) 50 (33.3) 24 (16.0) 63 (42.0) 2.84±1.19 

Total mean 2.91±0.95 

 

Scale:  Doesn’t Apply= 0, Never Stressful= 1, Occasionally Stressful=2, Frequently Stressful=3, Extremely Stressful=4
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Table (8): Relation between ICU Nurses’ Socio-demographic and Occupational  
                  Characteristics and Total Mean of ENSS N= (150) 
 

Socio-demographic characteristics ENSS 
Mean± SD 

Test of Significance 
p value 

Age:  

F=3.887 
P=0.010 * 

� ≤ 20-29 157.01±32.59 
� 30-39 153.66±23.12 
� 40-49 135.68±33.79 
� 40-≤60 152.00±11.26 

Sex:  
t= 1.402 
P=0.163 

� Male 144.29±36.10 
� Female 152.72±28.00 

Marital status:  
t= 3.371 

P=0.001* 
� Single 141.06±39.32 
� Married 157.97±19.84 

Having children:  
t= 1.984 

P=0.049* 
� Yes 155.45±18.65 
� No 145.78±39.52 

Level of education:  
F= 6.062 
P=0.003* 

� Diploma in nursing 158.59±21.35 
� Bachelor of nursing 146.55±33.20 

Years of Experience:  

F=4.644 
P=0.011* 

� Less than 2 years 157.18±35.19 
� 2-5 years 153.69±22.49 
� More than 5 years 138.54±32.38 

Occupational Characteristics:   
Hospital type:  

F=3.134 
P=0.027* 

� Ministry of health 157.10±08.26 
� University 157.54±31.62 
� Health insurance 147.75±36.89 

ICU type:  

F=7.349 
P=0.000* 

� GICU 156.64±25.16 
� CCU 130.25±41.63 
� SICU 147.00±26.21 
� Specialized ICU 158.76±03.50 

Residence:  
t=0.642 
P=0.424 

� Away from work 152.06±28.78 
� Near to work 147.42±33.58 

Transportation:  
t=0.124 
P=0.725 

� Not available 151.61±29.35 
� Available 149.81±29.35 

Work schedule:  
t=-2.056- 
P=0.042* 

� Morning 139.30±28.50 
� Rotating 153.09±29.78 

*Significance level p<0.05 
ENSS: Expended Nursing Stress Scale 
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 ̄ șĻů ŬȚņș;ŖŨ ŭĬũȷ̦ ŖŨ Ŭżŷɔ ̑ ģ › ; ̦ ŖŨ ŭ̦ Ĭū̇

­ Ĭ̆ ș; ;ŖŨ ̉ ŗ̌  ̇ Đ̆ ŖŨɔ › ŧũəŖŨ șůɔůŖŨ.  ſŴŨɔĬɔ
 › ГŻ ­ ;  ̇ ķģ ț ĬŖ ŬȚņș;ŖŨ ŭĬũȷ̦ ŖŨ ̉ ̆ ș; ;

 ̉ ŗ̌  żĬŨȚů;ŖŨ Ūŗ̇ ŖŨ › ūĶ ­ ;  ŬżĬŴŖŨ ŭĬũ̌ șŖŨ
 Ūŗ̇ ůĬ ũ̆ ĬŜ ­ ņŖɔ º› ; ̦ ŖŨ ŭəŴɔ ſůș¤Ŝɔ ̄ Ĭș;ŖŨ

ϳəȷ; ̑ ŴɔŖɔȷņůŖŨ ļ ɔĻůŖŨ.  
ŮŵũŅŦ ̸ źĸ:  
­ ;  ĢżəŖŨ ŭ¤ŨșżŖŨ ĸȘɘ żĬżŷů ɔɘ  ŭūū¤;ŖŨ › ;Ũɔ̦ ŖŨ

ŗŖ ̇ Đ̆­ Ĭ̆ ș; ;ŖŨ ­ Ĭū ̑ ģ ­ Ĭŗ; ũ̦ŖŨ ŭŧĬū  ŭĬũȷ̦ ŖŨ
ŬȚņș;ŖŨ.  

  
ŮŵũŅŦ ūļ̅ ż̄ ɘ ū;̅ ̋ ŅŦ:  

ŮŵũŅŦ Ŗ̅ŗ́ ŭŅŦ:  
ϳŨżŻů¤Ũ ϳ ů ϳ Ĭ; ̃ ůŖŨ ̑ ģṹ ņů¤ВŨ ̑ Ļ̃ ɔŖŨ  ĸȘɘ ̑ ģ
ŭ¤ŨșżŖŨ.  

ūȚŦżźŅŦ ū;̅ ̊ ɘ ϳ ŧķŗ:  
ϳ ů żĶ ŭ¤ŨșżŖŨ ĸȘɘ ȘĬĻȷů ŭů¤ ̑ ģ  ŮũĬũȷ̦ ŖŨ ­ ;

­ ĬĐŖũūŗŖ ŬȚņș;ŖŨ ŝū ̉ ůȷĬż;  ̉ ģ ŮũĬĻ́ ů¤;  ŭ̦ ūș
ɔ ŭĬșżȷņ¤АŨșɔəȷ;ż.  

Ŭŧ;ŧ̅ ũŅŦ ̈ ŗŲ ŬŦɘźŚ:  
 ̋ ;Ŵ ϳ ů żĶ › ГŻ ­ ;  ŮũȷũĬūŖŨ ů̋ ĬȚɔ ­ ũĬūů¤Ũ ũĬůŨȘ 

­ ̌ › ; ̦ ŖŨ ̇ ɔĐ̆ ŭķŗ̦ ů;ŖŨ Ůũ̆ ș; ;ū  Ŭżŷɔ
ŬȚņș;ŖŨ ŭĬũȷ̦ ŖŨ  ̇ Đ̆ ŖŨ ț ũĬķ;  Ůȷ; ̆ ů ̑ ůŖŨ

̋ ¤ɔ;ŖŨ ̉ ̆ Ĭș;ůŖŨ )ENSS.(  
  

űťŧŭ;ŅŦ:  
ŮĻ́ ņ ųŧũůȷ ŭĬŖũŷŖŨ ŭ¤ŨșżŖŨ  ­ Ŝ̑ ̆ ș; ;  ŭĬũȷ̦ ŖŨ
ŬȚņș;ŖŨ › ; ̦ ŖŨ ̇ ɔĐ̆  ­ ;  Ũɔȷũ̦Ĭ ºɔɔ›  ũķģENSS 
Ŝ żŴɔ ­ϳ ̈ ̌ Ŝ ̇ ɔĐ̆ ŖŨșżũ̃ ;  ­ ũņ › ; ̦ ŖŨ řŪ̌

) ̇ ¤ɔů;=Ô.Ï ı±Ï .ÙÌ( ſ ĬŗĬ ºŮɔ; ̄ Ĭș;ŖŨ 
̋ ĶɔůɔŜ Ůɔ;ŖŨ )̇ ¤ɔů;=Ô.Ï Ì±Ï .ÛÏ( º › ņṹ ;ŖŨ
ŭķŗ̦ ů;ŖŨ ũū­ Ĭģș́ ;Ŗ )̇ ¤ɔů;=Ó.ÙÚ±Ï .ÙÌ( º

› ; ũ̦ůŖŨ ŨșĬŻŜɔ ̉ ̆ ș;ŖŨ ̋ ; ϳ ɘș¤Ŝɔ )̇ ¤ɔů;
=Ó.Û±Ï .ÙÓ.( ȚĬĬ;ůŖŨ ­ ũņ ŰżŷŖŨ ›ĶŜ ũ̇ Đ̆ 

ũɘŨșĬ ̉ ̆ ș; ; ŬȚņș;ŖŨ ŭĬũȷ̦ ŖŨ ̇ ¤ɔů;ū 
Ì .Ï Ù±Ì .ÓÌ.  
ŮĻ́ ņɔ ŭ¤ŨșżŖŨ ųŧũůȷ ­ Ŝ › ;Ũɔ̦ ŖŨ  ŭĬ̌ ũ;ůŴВŨ

ɔ ŭĬȷə;ŖŨɔ ŭĬģŨș̸ ɔ; ĬżŖŨ­ Ĭņșṹ ;ŖŨ ­ ; )ºș; ̦ ŖŨ 
ŭĬ̌ ũ;ůŴВŨ ŭŖũŷŖŨ ɐɔů¤; ɔ ºŬșūŻŖŨ ŮŨɔȷ¤ º

ɔ ϳ Ĭŗ̦ ůŖŨ› ; ̦ ŖŨ › ɔżŴ (ŨșĬūņ ŨșĬűŝů șűŢů  ̉ ģ
ϳ ɘșɔ̃ ů ̇ ɔĐ̆ Ŗ › ; ̦ ŖŨ.  

  
 ū́ БŹŅŦ  
Ů̃ ŗŻ ųŧũůȷ  ŭ¤ŨșżŖŨ ̉ Ŗţ ­ Ŝ › ; ̦ ŖŨ ̇ ɔĐ̆ ­ Ĭū
̉ ̆ ș; ; ŬȚņș;ŖŨ ŭĬũȷ̦ ŖŨ ȷũņ Ůū ŭĬŖũ̌ ̑ ĻņĬ ũ;
ũɘșũūů̌ В ŬșĬ̇ Ż.   

  
Ŭŧ̅ ́ ɘŭŅŦ :  

ŭ¤ŨșżŖŨ ĸȘɘ ŭ;ə;  șũűŚ ũəŖ ŭ¤șũ; ;Ŗ  ̄ Ĭș;ůŖŨ
ɔ ̉ Ŗţ șĬ́ ůżũ; ů̌ Ũ ŭĬ;ɘŜ ŭəŴŨɔ;ŖŨ ŮũĬŴĬůŨșů¤Ũ 

ż̌ ũ¤ů żĶ ̑ ůŖŨ ̑ ģ ϳŴŷ › Ĭŗķů ̇ ɔĐ̆ ŖŨ ̑ ȷũ̦Ĭ ̑ ůŖŨ 
ȷ;ũə ̉ ̆ ș; ; ŬȚņș;ŖŨ ŭĬũȷ̦ ŖŨ Ŭżŷɔ.  
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